
Activities for Elementary School Social Studies
James W. Stockard Jr., Mary Margaret Wogan

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1577666720
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1577666720
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1577666720


Activities for Elementary School Social Studies

James W. Stockard Jr., Mary Margaret Wogan

Activities for Elementary School Social Studies James W. Stockard Jr., Mary Margaret Wogan
Revised edition of the invaluable guidebook for developing interest, meaning, and true understanding in the
classroom! According to Piaget, all higher-order thinking skills have their bases in activities involving
concrete manipulation and observation. The third edition of this highly regarded collection of social studies
activities, now with new contributing author Mary Margaret Wogan, continues to be based on the premise
that children learn best through experiences and activities learning by doing. It features new activities for
each social studies category (geography, history, anthropology, sociology, economics, political science, and
interdisciplinary). Three important additions to the key elements of the easy-to-follow activity format make it
easier for instructors to meet standards-based curriculum requirements:

- A detailed treatment of National Council of Social Studies standards addressed

- Specific multiple intelligences addressed (This concept is reinforced by a new multiple intelligences section
in the back of the book)

- Useful Web site(s) for group/individual research (URLs for sites that will expand or enrich the learning
experience for the activity)

By engaging pupils in meaningful, worthwhile social studies activities, instructors can emphasize the
processes of learning rather than the products, resulting in a richly rewarding experience for pupils and
teacher alike.

Titles of related interest from Waveland Press: Dynneson et al., Designing Effective Instruction for
Secondary Social Studies, Third Edition (ISBN 9781577665199); Farris, Elementary and Middle School
Social Studies: An Interdisciplinary, Multicultural Approach, Seventh Edition (ISBN 9781478622802); and
Stockard, Handbook for Teaching Secondary School Social Studies (ISBN 9781577664543).
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From reader reviews:

Roxanne Jimenez:

The book Activities for Elementary School Social Studies can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book
Activities for Elementary School Social Studies? Several of you have a different opinion about publication.
But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using
your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; it is possible
to share all of these. Book Activities for Elementary School Social Studies has simple shape nevertheless,
you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and
read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Jonathan McLean:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense
happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Activities for
Elementary School Social Studies is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Kim Gray:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Activities for Elementary School Social Studies the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering
in every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each and every
word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you
never get before. The Activities for Elementary School Social Studies giving you an additional experience
more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful data for your better life in this particular era.
So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind will probably be
pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary
wasting spare time activity?

Graham Ayala:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine
a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Activities for Elementary School Social Studies provide you with a new experience in reading



through a book.
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