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This book looks at the common techniques used to prepare, purify and identify chemicals. Topics including
distillation, recrystallisation, chromatography, elemental analysis, atomic absorption spectroscopy and mass
spectrometry are discussed, and are illustrated on video on the accompanying CD-ROMs. Infrared and
nuclear magnetic resonance spectroscopy are covered entirely through multi-media, with animations and
virtual experiments. The reader is provided with examples for interpretation, and can draw in the structures
using the software provided. There is also a set of interactive self-assessment questions. In all, the multi-
media software suite comprises more than twelve hours of material. Separation, Purification and
Identification concludes with a Case Study on Forensic Science, in which illustrations of criminal cases
where spectroscopic techniques provided evidence are given. The Molecular World series provides an
integrated introduction to all branches of chemistry for both students wishing to specialise and those wishing
to gain a broad understanding of chemistry and its relevance to the everyday world and to other areas of
science. The books, with their Case Studies and accompanying multi-media interactive CD-ROMs, will also
provide valuable resource material for teachers and lecturers. (The CD-ROMs are designed for use on a PC
running Windows 95, 98, ME or 2000.)
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From reader reviews:

Bernard Walker:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand up than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Separation, Purification and
Identification book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Jodie Kahl:

The publication untitled Separation, Purification and Identification is the publication that recommended to
you to read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot
of research when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also
can get the e-book of Separation, Purification and Identification from the publisher to make you much more
enjoy free time.

Patrica Fussell:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Separation, Purification and
Identification which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Pamela Postma:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the Separation, Purification and Identification when you essential it?
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